AGENDA ITEM FOR ADMINISTRATIVE MEETING  (

FROM (DEPT/ DIVISION): County Counsel

SUBJECT:

) Discussion only
(X) Action

Weed Control Products Contract for 2024

Background: The County issued a request for
proposals for the purchase of weed control
products for 2024. Four proposals were received.
The unit pricing as adjusted is:

Nutrien - $4,209.57
Helena - 4,316.76
Wilbur-Ellis — 4,371.22
Heritage - $4,638.27

The recommendation is to award the contract to the
lowest proposal.

Requested Action:  Approve contract with Nutrien
for the purchase of weed control products for 2024

ATTACHMENTS: Summary; Proposals

*khkhkkkkkkkhik For I nte rn al U se O n Iy************

Checkoffs:

) Dept. Heard (copy)
) Budget (copy)
Fiscal

Legal (copy)

(
(
§
( (Other - List:)

)
X )
)

Scheduled for meeting on:  January 17, 2024

Action taken:

To be notified of Meeting:
Teddy Orr

Needed at Meeting:

TEAAAAAARAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAArAAAhAAAAErAhdhhhkhhhkhhhkihhkiihiiiiiik

Follow-up:




Product Container Size UOM Nutrien Nutrien Helena Helena W Ellis W. Ellis Heritage Heritage
Esplanade 200 SC 2.5 gal gal S 1,437.44)|S 1,437.44|S 1,437.44|S 1,437.44|S 1,437.44]S 1,437.44 | S 1,437.44|S 1,437.44|2.5
RoundUp Quick Pro |2.5 gal gal S 60.57 | $ 60.57 | $ 62.81]5S 628118 7541158 75.41 1S 85.86| S 85.86 |2.5
Frequency 1 gal gal S 679.00 | S 679.00 | S 679.00 | S 679.00| S 679.00| S 679.00|S 647.82]5S 647.82 |1
Rejuvra 1qt qt S 319.54 S 351.61 S 319.54 No Bid No Bid 1
Rejuvra 2.5 gal gal S 1,064.45 S 1,171.30 S 1,064.45 No Bid No Bid 2.5
Escort 8 oz 0z S 16.32 | $ 16.32] s 1752 | $ 1752 ]S 17.78 | $ 17.78 | S 27.76 | $ 27.76 |1
Escort 11b 0z S 32.64 S 35.04 S 35.56 No Bid No Bid 1
Telar 8 oz 0z S 12.10] $ 12.10] s 12.10] $ 12.10] s 14.60 | $ 1460 S 16.19 | $ 16.19 |8
Telar 11b Ib S = S = $ = $ = $ = $ = No Bid S - |1
Freelexx 2.5 gal gal S 32.75]S 32.75]1S 32.75]S 32.75]1S 32.75]S 32.75] S 32.75]$ 32.75 2.5
Game On 2.5 gal gal S 65.55| S 65.55 ]S 65.55 | S 65.55 ]S 65.55| S 65.55] S 65.55 | $ 65.55 |2.5
Milestone 1qt qt S 7250 S 72501 S 72501 S 72501 S 7250 S 72501 S 82.25]S 82.25 |11
Milestone 2.5 gal gal S 290.00 | S 290.00 | S 290.00 | S 290.00 | S 290.00| S 290.00]S 329.00]|s 329.00 2.5
Curtail 2.5 gal gal S 53.40 S 50.00 S 56.90 No Bid No Bid 2.5
Vastlan 1qt qt No Bid S - No Bid S - S 26.25 S 26.25 1
Vastlan 2.5 gal gal S 105.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 105.00| S 105.00| $ 105.00|$ 105.00]|$ 105.00 |2.5
Grazon Next HL 2.5 gal gal S 4363 |5 4363 ]S 59.00 | $ 59.00 | S 51.50 | S 51.50] S 65.88 ]S 65.88 |2.5
High Noon 2.5 gal gal S 94.00 | S 94.00 | S 94.00 | $ 94.00 | S 94.00 | $ 94.00| S 94.00 | S 94.00 |2.5
Opensite 1.251b 0z S 98.00 | $ 98.00 | S 98.00 | $ 98.00 | S 98.00 | $ 98.00| S 97.92 ]S 122.40 |1.25
Transline 2.5 gal gal S 135.80 | $ 135.80| $ 13157 | $ 131.57|S 143.10] S 143.10| S 200.00| S 200.00 2.5
Tordon 22K 2.5 gal gal S 4859 | s 4859 ]S 54.00 | S 54.00 | S 57.10| S 57.10] S 85.86| S 85.86 |2.5
Vista XRT 2.5 gal gal S 144.00 | $ 144,00 | S 136.84 | $ 136.84|S 14830 S 14830|S 204.34]|5S 204.34 12.5
Plateau 2.5 gal gal S 11342 ] $ 11342 ]S 110.00 | $ 110.00 | S 147.10] S 147.10| S 147.28 ]| S 147.28 |2.5
Pendulum AC 2.5 gal gal S 45.47 | s 45.47 | s 44.03 | s 44.03|s 50.75 | S 50.75] S 4891 ]S 4891 |2.5
Venue 1qt qt S 113.00 S 127.35 S 103.68 No Bid No Bid 1
Speedzone 2.5 gal gal S 91.00 91.00 | S 91.00 91.00 | S 91.00 | $ 91.00| S 72.00] S 72.00 |2.5
Tzone 2.5 gal gal S 80.00 | S 80.00 | S 80.00 | S 80.00| S 80.00 | S 80.00 | S 80.00 | S 80.00 |2.5
Lockdown SC 2.5 gal gal S 323.62 S 300.00 S  347.40 No Bid No Bid 2.5
Polaris 21b 2.5 gal gal S 60.00 | S 60.00 | S 64.50 | S 64.50 | S 63.50 | S 63.50] S 7092 ]S 70.92 12.5
Polaris 41b 2.5 gal gal S 100.20 | $ 100.20 | $ 112.40] $ 112.40|S 110601 S 11060 | S 127.44 ]S 127.44 2.5
2, 4-D + Dicamba 2.5 gal gal S 15.83 | $ 15.83 ] s 24.15]S 24.15] S 1555 | $ 1555] S 24721 S 24.72 12.5
2, 4-D amine (41b) 2.5 gal gal S 1290 ] $ 12901 s 16.10 | $ 16.10| s 12.75] $ 12.75| S 15.48 | $ 15.48 |2.5
2, 4-D amine (41b) 30 gal gal S 1290 ] $ 12901 s 16.00 | $ 16.00 | s 12.75] $ 12.75| S 1739 ] $ 17.39 |30
2, 4-D amine (41b) 265 tote |gal S 12.80 ] $ 12.80] s 1550 | $ 1550 ] s 12.22 ]S 12.22] s 16.30| $ 16.30 |265
Triclopyr 3A 25gal |gal S 4681|$ 4681 |8 5000|S 5000|5 48903 4890 | S 5434|%  5434[25
Triclopyr 4 2.5 gal gal S 58.04 | S 58.04 | S 62.10| S 62.10 ]S 60.60 | S 60.60 | S 67.39] S 67.39 12.5
Glyphosate plus (41b) 2.5 gal ~ [gal $ 1556 S 1556 |5 1527 |5 1527 |S 1275 1275|S 21465 2146 |25
Glyphosate plus (41b) |30 gal gal S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | s 15.05| $ 15.05] s 12.75 ] $ 12.75| S 20.65] S 20.65 |30
Glyphosate plus (41b) |265 tote |gal $ 14311]$ 1431 ]S 1470 | S 14.70 | S 1330 S 13.30| $ 20.38 | S 20.38 |265




Aquatic Glyphosate  [2.5 gal  ]gal s 2197 2197 S 2268[5  2268[$  24.00 24008 42115 421125
Blue Dye 1 gal gal S 46.59 46.59 | S 49.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 38.07 38.07]1$ 39.18 | $ 39.18 |1
Blue Dye 2.5 gal gal S 46.59 46.59 | S 4850 | $ 4850 | S 34.60 3460 S 19.75 | $ 19.75 12.5
Compadre/or Equiv |1 gal gal S 20.03 No Bid S 30.00 No Bid 1
Deposit aid 2.5gal |gal $ 14.87 $ 19.90 $  45.00 No Bid 2.5
Drift control 2.5 gal gal S 9.52 9.52]S 3777 | $ 3777 | S 30.00 30.00]$ 60.00 | $ 60.00 |2.5
MSO 2.5 gal gal S 13.16 13.16 | S 1577 | $ 15.77 | $ 20.00 2000 $ 14.45| S 14.45 2.5
No Foam 1 gal gal $ 2572 S 2944 $  11.90 S 677 1
Non-Ionic surf 2.5 gal gal S 10.81 10.81 | S 1533 ]S 1533 | S 15.00 15.00 | $ 1114 | $ 11.14 12.5
Non-Ionic surf 30 gal gal S 10.69 10.69 | S 1533 ]S 1533 | S 15.00 15.00 | $ 9.94]5$ 9.94 130
Sylicone based surf 2.5 gal gal S 20.75 2075 | S 33.50 | $ 33501 S 68.00 68.00]$ 34.94 | S 34.94 12.5
Tank Cleaner 1 gal gal $ 17.26 S 8.00 S 40.00 S 17.97 1
$ 6,194.10 4,209.57 S 6,409.40 S 4,316.76 $ 6,451.90 4,371.22 S 4,664.78 |S 4,638.27

Units

Units



Nutrien

Solutions
Date: 12/28/2023
RE: Umatilla County Weed Control (RFP)

. Nutrien delivers all our VM chemicals from our warehouse in Salem, OR with our own

delivery trucks or by common carrier.

Warehouse hours of operation: 6:00 am to 5:00 pm. Monday to Friday
Order Desk Phone: 800-452-8324
Office Phone: 503-304-2070
Office Fax: 503-463-1670

Dennis Capper — Cell phone: 360-605-6230

All bulk containers provided by Nutrien will be picked up by our delivery trucks and
returned to our Salem warehouse.

Nutrien will pick up any Multiple Rinsed herbicide containers and
deliver them to Salem, OR for recycling.

. Nutrien can provide Umatilla County Weed Control employee’s product

updates on new herbicides and any technical training needed for the proper application
of herbicides.

. Price quote is valid through December 31, 2024,

Dennis Capper — VM Territory Manager
Nutrien Solutions
Dennis.capper@nutrien.com

e Y



Esplanade 200 SC Envu e gal $1437.44 $3583 60

Roundup Quick Pro SC Envu 2.5 gal gal $60 57 $151.43

Frequency Envu 1 gal m $679.00 $670,00

Rejuvra Envu 1qt gal | s31e.54 $31954

Rejuvra Envu 2.5 gal gal $1064,45 $2661.13

Escort Envu 80z oz §2.04 $16.32

Escort Envu 11b oz $2.04 33264

Telar Envu 8 0z b §12.10 $ $96.80
Telar Envu 11b 1b Discontinued
Freelexx Corteva 2.5 gal gal $32.75 $81.88

GameOn Corteva 2.5 gal al $65.55 $163.88

Milestone Corteva 1qt qt $72.50 $72.50

Milestone Corteva 2.5 gal 260.00 $725.00

Curtail Corteva 2.5 gal 1 $53.40 $133.50

Freelexx Corteva 2.5 gal zal $32.75 $81.88

Vastlan Corteva 1qgt qt NO BID
Vastlan Corteva 2.5 gal gal $105.00 $262.50
GrazonNext HL Corteva 2.5 :1 gal $4363 $100.08

HighNoon Corteva 2.5 gal gal  [$94.00 $235.00

Opensite Corteva 1.251b 0z $98.00 §122.50

Transline Corteva 2.5 gal gal  |s$13580 $330.50

Tordon 22K Corteva 2.5 gal | gal $48.50 $121.48

Vista XRT Corteva 2.5 pal $144.00 $360.00

Plateau BASF 2.5 $113.42 $283.55

Pendulum AguaCap BASF Vo gal $45.47 $11268

Venue Nichino Americg1 gt at $113.00 $113.00

SpeedZone PBI-Gordons 2.5 gal gal $91.00 $227 50

Tzone PBI-Gordons 2.5 gal gal $80.00 $200.00

LockDown SC NuFarm 2.5 :1 gal $32362 $809.05

_Polaris (2ib) NuFarm 2.5 al $60.00 $150.00

Polaris AC (41b) NuFarm 2.5 gal oal $100.20 $250.50

NON BRAND SPECIFIC [Manufacture rice Per UOM |Total Notes

2, 4-D + Dicamba Any 2.5 gal $15.83 $30.58 Weed Master - Rifie D - etc
2| 4.D amine !‘Hb) Any 2 gel §12.80 $32.25 Platoon - Weedar 64 - etc
2, 4D amine (41b) Any 30 $12.90 $387.00

2, 4-D amine (41b) Any 265 gal (tote) |gal $12.80 $3382.00

Triclopyr 3A/or Equiv An 2.5 gal gal $46.81 $117.03 Element 3A
Triclopyr 4/or Equiv Any 2.5 pgal al $58.04 $145.10 Element 4
Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 2.5 gal al $15.56 $38.90

Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 30 gal 1 $15.00 $450.00

Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 265 gal (tote $14.31 $3792.15

Adquatic Glyphosate (51b) JAny 2.5 gal $21.97 $54.93

Blue Dye Any 1 gal gal $46 598 $46.59

Blue Dye Any 2.5 gal |gal $46.50 $116.48

Compadre Any 1 gal $20.03 $20.03

Deposit aid :;ny 2.5 gal al $14.87 $37.18 Nufilm IR - Grounded - Attach - etc
Drift control Any 2.5 ga_l Fga_(.l $6.52 $23.80 crosshair - etc
MSO Any 2.5 gal $13.16 $32.90

No Foam Any 1 Gal Gal §25.72 $25.72 Foam buster - no foam - etc
MNon-lonic surf Any 2.5 ga!_ al $10.81 $27.03 spreader 90 - etc
Non-lonic surf Any 30 gal gal $10.69 $320.70 spreader 90 - etc
Sylicone based surf Any 2.5 gal $20.75 $51.88 Syl-tac - Dyne-Amic - Phase - atd
Tank Cleaner Any 1 Gal gal $17.26 $17.26




Theodore Orr

Umatilla County Weed Control

3920 Westgate

Pendleton, OR 97801

(541) 278-5462 Cell # (541) 969-9021
email: theodore.orr@umatillacounty.net

Bid By:

Helena Agri Enterprises LLC
Scott Tweedy

4802 N Florida St

Spokane, WA 99217
509-961-2621

Tweed helenaagri.com

[BRAND SPECIFIC PRODUCTS [V Container Sie_[UOM _| Price Per UOM | TotalPer Container .
Ilisp]anad.c 200 SC Envu 2.5 gal gal S 143744 | S 3,593.60
Roundup Quick Pro SC Baver 2.5 gal gal S 62.81 s 157.02
Frequency BASF ! gal gal S 679.00 | $ 679.00
Rejuvra Envu lqt qt 5 35161 |8 351.61
Rejuvra Envu 2.5 gal gal S 1,171.30 | S 292825
Escort Envu Soz oz S 2.19 | § 17.52
Escort Envu 1lb oz S 2.19 15 35.04
Telar Envu 8oz Ib S 12.10 [ S 96.80
Telar Envu 11b Ib

Freelexx Corteva 25 gal sal S 327515 81.87
GameOn Coricva 2.5 gal gal S 65.55 | S 163.87
Milestone Corteva I qt at S 7250 | S 72.50
Milestone Corteva 25 gal gal S 290.00 | S 725.00
Curtail Corteva 2.5 gal gal $ 50.00 | 8 125.00
Freelexx Corteva 2.5 gal gal S 3275 | S 81.87
Vastlan Corteva lqt qt

Vastlan Corteva 2.5 gal gal S 105.00 | S 262.50
GrazonNext HL Corteva 2.5 gal gal S 59.00 | S 147.50
HighNoon Corteva 2.5 gal gal S 94.00 | S 235.00
Opensite Corteva 1.251b Ib S 98.00 | S 122.50
Transline Corteva 2.5 pal gal 5 131.57 | 3 328.92
Tordon 22K Corteva 2.5 gal gal S 54.00 | S 135.00
Vista XRT Corteva 2.5 gal gal S 136.84 | S 342.10
Plateau BASF 2.5 gal gal S 110.00 | S 110.00
Pendulum AquaCap BASF 2.5 gal gal S 44.03 | S 110.07
Venue Nichino America |l gt gt S 127.35 | S 127.35
SpeedZone PBI-Gordons 2.5 gal gal 3 91.00 ] S 227.50
Tzone PBI-Gordons 2.5 pal gal S 80.00 | 200.00
LockDown SC NuFarm 2.5 gal gal S 300.00 | S 750.00
Polaris (21b) NuFarm 2.5 gal gal S 64.50 | S 161.25
Polaris AC (4Ib) NuFarm 2.5 gal gal S 112.40 | S 281.00
NON BRAND SPECIFIC Mamfacture  |Container Size JuOM | Price Per uOM itk

2,4-D + Dicamba Any 2.5 gal gal S 24.15 | S 60.37
2, 4-D amine (41b) Any 2.5 gal gal S 16.10 | $ 40.25
2, 4-D amine (41b) Any 30 gal gal S 16.00 | § 480.00
2, 4-D amine (41b) Any 265 gal (tote)  |gal S 15.50 | S 4,107.50
Triclopyr 3A/er Equiv Any 2.5 gal gal § 50.00 | S 125.00
Triclopyr 4/or Equiv Any 2.5 gal gal S 62.10 | S 155.25
Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 2.5 gal gal S 1527 | $ 38.17
Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 30 gal gal $ 1505 | S 451.50
Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 265 gal (tote)  [gal S 14.70 | S 3,895.50
Aquatic Glyphosate (51b) Any 2.5 gal gal S 22,68 | S 56.70




Blue Dye Any 1 gal gal 5 4900 ] S 49.00

Blue Dye Any 2.5 gal gal S 4850 | $ 121.25
Compadre Any 1 gal gal

Deposit aid Any 2.5 pal gal 5 19.90 | § 49.75 Groundes
Dirift control Any 2.5 gal gal s 37.77 s 94.42 Jtified
i il i s 15771 s 39.42

Ho o Any 1Gal gal |$ 29.44 | $ LT N M
Non-lonic surf Any 2.5 gal gal 4 1533 | § 38.32
Non-lonic surf Any 30 gal gal S 1533 | 459.90

Sylicone based surf Any 2.5 gal gal < 3350 S 83.75 [omeAm=
Tank Cleaner Any 21b Ib s 8.00 | $ 16.00

N <y~

Scott Tweedy

Branch Manager - Northwest Specialty

Helena Agri Enterprises LLC




Umatilla County
Request for Proposal
Purchase of Weed Control Products 2024

Wilbur-Ellis Co. (WECO) bid addendums

Price valid through 12/31/24

Wilbur-Ellis will deliver all products requested in a timely matter on Tuesdays and/or
Thursdays of each week (except holidays recognized by WECO).

Accommodations can be met to provide products outside of normal delivery schedule, if
agreed on by Umatilla County and Wilbur-Ellis.

All plastic containers 2.5 gallons and smaller, triple rinsed with labels and lids removed,
can be picked up by Wilbur-Ellis for disposal, free of charge.

Totes and 30-gallon drums, triple rinsed with labels removed, can be picked up by
Wilbur-Ellis for disposal, free of charge with timely notification to drivers (WECO
paperwork must be included for pick-up)

SDS sheets can be provided upon request with products with delivery (one time only per
product)
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1 2024 Wilbur-Ellis Weed Control Bid for Umatilla County

- Product Container Size UOM S/UOM $/Container
4 Esplanade 2008C 2.5 gal gal $1.437.44 $3.593.60
7 Roundup Quickpro SC Total 2.5 gal gal $75.41 $188.53

8 Frequency 1 gal gal $679.00 $679.00
9 Rejuvra 1 gt bo $319.54 $319.54
10 Rejuvra 2.5 gal al $1,064.45 $2.661.13
11 Escort XP 8oz bo $17.78 $17.78
12 _ Escort XP 16 oz bo $35.56 $35.56
13 Telar XP 8oz oz $14.60 $116.80
15 Freelexx 2.5 gal gal $32.75 $81.88
16 GameOn 2.5 gal gal $65.55 $163.88
17 Milestone 1gt bo $72.50 $72.50
18 Milestone 2.5 gal gal $290.00 $725.00
19 Curtail 2.5 gal gal $56.90 $142.25
20 Vastlan 1 gt bo $26.25 $26.25
21 Vastlan 2.5 gal al $105.00 $262.50
22 Grazonnext HL 2 gal gal $51.50 $103.00
23 HighNoon 2.5 gal al $94.00 $235.00
24 Opensight 1.25 Ib bo $98.00 $122.50
25 Transline 2.5 gal gal $143.10 $357.75
26 Tordon 22K 2.5 gal zal $57.10 $142.75
27 Vista XRT 25 ga] gal $148.30 $370.75
28 Platean 1 gal gal $147.10 $147.10
29 Pendulum AC 2.5 gal gal $50.75 $126.88
30 Venue 1 gt bo $103.68 $103.68
31 Speed Zone EW 25gal | gal $91.00 $227.50
32 T-Zone 2.5 gal gal $80.00 $200.00
33 Lock Down SC 2.5 gal oal $347.40 $868.50
34 Polaris (2 Ib) 2.5 gal gal $63.50 $158.75
35 Polaris AC Complete (4 Ib) 2.5 gal oal $110.60 $276.50
36

37 Container Size | UOM $/UOM $/Contai
38 2,4-D + Dicamba 2.5 gal gal $15.55 $38.88
39 2,4-D amine 2.5 gal gal $12.75 $31.88
40 2.4-D amine 30 gal gal $12.75 $382.50
41 ZS#D amine 270 gal gal $12.22 $3,299.40
42 Triclopyr 3A or equiv 2.5 gal __gal $48.90 $122.25
43 Triclopyr 4 or equiv 2.5 gal gal $60.60 $151.50
44 Glyphosate 4 Ib 265 tote gal $12.75 $3,378.75
45 Glyphosate 4 1b 30 gal gal $12.75 $382.50
46 Glyphosate 4 Ib 2.5 gal gal $13.30 $33.25
47 Aquatic labeled glyphosate (5 1b) 2.5 eal _gal $24.00 $60.00
49
50 Container Size | UOM $/UOM $/Container
51 Blue Dye 1 gal ~ pal $38.07 $38.07
52 Biue Dye 2.5 gal _gal $34.60 $86.50
53 Compadre or equiv 2.5 gal gal $30.00 $75.00
54 Deposition Aid 2.5 gal " pal $45.00 $112.50
1] Drift Control 2.5 gal gal $30.00 $75.00
56 MSO 2.5 gal al $20.00 $50.00
57 NO Foam 1qt bo $11.90 $11.90
58 NIS 2.5 gal al $15.00 $37.50
59 NIS 30 gal oal $15.00 $450.00
60 Sylicone based Surfactant 2.5 gal gal $68.00 $170.00
61 Tank Cleaner 1 gal _gal $40.00 $40.00
62

63 Price valid through Dec 31, 2024
64
65 Prepared by Drew Rountree o

66 977777, JJAT

67
68 Wilbur-Ellis Co

69 150 E Curtis Ave

70 Walla Walla, WA 99362

71 509-928-4512




sk HERITAGE
Bid Development Manager 7400 S Hwy 121

Heritage Landscape Supply Group  McKinney., TX 75070 LANDSCAPE SUPPLY GROUP
Phone: (214) 491-4149 www hefitagelondsc apesupplyaroup.com

VENDOR INFORMATION

Company Name (as shown on income tax return)- Heritage Landscape Supply Group

Purchase Order Mailing Address- (7440 State Highway 121)

City, State and Zip-( McKinney Texas 75070)

Vendor Contact Name: Jeff Baker

Title: Bid Development Manager

Email: Jeff. Baker@Heritageppg.com

Phone (207) 606-9119

U.S. Federal Identification Number: 46-1116383

Website Address: Heritageppg.com

Payment (Remit) Address: 901.Main Street
City, State and Zip (Dallas, Texas 75202)

Name of U.S. Financial Institution (Bank) Bank of America

U.S. Financial Institution (Bank) Address:( 901.Main Street Dallas, Texas 75202)

Name of Authorized Signatory: Jeff Baker

Email address: _Jeff.Baker@heritageppg.com

Signature:

Date: Q1faz/2024
| [
including area code that can receive TEXT messages: (207) _606-9119

The phone n



B oo insmn [ZJHERITAGE

Heritage Landscape Supply Group  McKinney, TX 75070 LANDSCAPE SUPPLY GROUP
Phone: (214) 491-4149 www.heritagelandscopesupplygroup.com

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc. Delivery Timeframes Letter

Orders ship next-day from our distribution warehouses located across the United States
and we have direct lines to our manufacturer vendors with the added ability to direct-
ship many of these products straight from the manufacturer if we have a bulk order that
exceeds current stock.

We have a proven track record of servicing local, state, and federal government entities in
a timely manner. Our standard timeframe for government entities is receiving their
product within 7-days from placing their order with us.



te
HP DROPLEX 1G

WU ATMOS 2.5G

WU FOAM FORCE QT
WINDSURF PRO 2.5G
WINDSURF PRO 30G
HP AIRCOVER 1G
HP POSTFLIGHT 1G

BRAND SPECIFIC PRODUCTS |[Manufacture _|container Sizeluom __|Price Per UOM [Total per Container [Notes

Esplanade 200 SC Envu 2.5 gal [zal $1437.44 _ |$3.593.60

Roundup Quick Pro SC Envu 2.5 gal al $85.86 $214.65

Frequency Envu 1 gal 1 $647.82 $647.82

Rejuvra Envu 1 gt ] No Bid No Bid

Rejuvra Envu 2.5 gal 1 No Bid No Bid

Escort Envu 8 oz 0z $3.47 $27.76

Escort Envu 1 b oF No Bid No Bid

Telar Envu 8 0z b 516.19 $129.52 priced per oz

Telar Envu 1l b No Bid No Bid

Freelexx Corteva 2.5 gal gal $32.75 $81.87

GameOn Corteva 2.5 gal $65.55 $163.87

Milestone Corteva 1gt qt 582.25 $82.25

Milestone Corteva 2.5 gal 1 $329.00 $822.50

Curtail Corteva 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid

Freclexx Corteva 2.5 gal $32.75 $81.87

Vastlan Corteva 1 qt qt 26.25 $26.25

Vastlan Corteva 2 SEJ_ i ﬁ‘l 05.00 $262.50

GrazonNext HL Corteva 2.5 gal 1 565.88 3164.70 GRAZONNEXT HL 2G
HighNoon Coneva 2.5 gal 1 94.00 $235.00

Opensite Corteva 1.25 Ib 0z $6.12 $6.12 OPENSIGHT 1.25L8
Transline Corteva 2.5 gal [gal §200.00 $500.00

Tordon 22K Cornteva 2.5 gal 1 $85.86 $214.65

Vista XRT Corteva 2.5 gal gal $204.34 $510.85

Plateau BASF 2.5 gal gal $147.28 $3,682.00

Pendulum AgquaCap BASF 2.5 gal gal $48.91 $122.27

Venue Nichino Americd! gt qt No Bid No Bid

SpeedZone PBl-Gordons 2.5 gal gal 572.00 $180.00

Tzone PBI-Gordons |25 gal gal $80.00 $200.00 T-ZONE SE 2.5G
LockDown §C MNuFarm 2.5 gal gal No Bid No Bid
Polaris (21b) NuFarm 2.5 gal al $70.92 $177.30

Polaris AC (41b) NuFarm 2.5 gal gal $127.44 $318.60

NON BRAND SPECIFIC |Manufacture __ |Container Size]UOM Price Per UOM |Total per Container [Notes

2. 4-D + Dicamba Any 2.5 gal ;;24-72 $61.80 Weed Master - Rifle D - etc
2. 4-D amine (41b) Any 2.5 gal 1 $15.48 $38.70 Platoon - Weedar 64 - etc

2, 4-D amine (41b) Any 30 gal 1 517.39 $521.70 A-D AMINE ALLIGARE 304
2. 4-1) amine {41b) Any 265 gal (tote) |gal 516.30 $4 £01.00 2,4-D AMINE ALLIGARE 274
Triclopyr 3A/or Eguiv Any 2 5 gal 1 $54.34 $135.85 Flemen: 1A

Triclopyr 4/0r Equiv Any 2.5 gal $67.39 $168.47 Flement: &

Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 2.5 gal $21.46 $53.65 RANGER PRO 2.5G
Glyphosaie plus (41b) Any 30 eal | 520.65 $619.50 RANGER PRO 30G
Glyphosate plus (41b) Any 265 gal (1ote) |gal 520.38 $5,400.70 RANGER PRO 265G
Aquatic Glyphosate (5lb) JAny 2.5 gal 1 542,11 $105.27 ROUNDUP CUSTOM 2.5G
Blue Dye Any 1 gal ] $39.18 $39.18 WU MYSTIC LAKE BLUE 1
Blue Dye Any 2.5 gal 1 $19.75 $49.37 WU MYSTIC SPIBLUE 2.59
Compadre Any 1 gal 1 No Bid No Bid

Deposit aid Any 2.5 gal : No Bid No Bid Nufilm IR - Grounded - Attach
Drift control Any 2.5 gal $60.00 $150.00 quosshaic_ete

MSO Any 2.5 gal )y 514.45 $36.12

No Foam Any 1qt qt 56.77 $6.77 T T —— ——
Non-lonic surf Any 2.5 gal E $11.14 $27.85 apsandariit—eto-
Non-lonic surf Any 30 gal 1 59.94 $298.20 dor 00 ate
Sylicone based surf Any 2.5 pal 1 534.94 $87.35 YT Trprrefrmme—F ot
Tank Cleaner Any 1 gal gal $17.97 $17.97




